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The story of Maya Angelou’s extraordinary life has been chronicled in her multiple bestselling
autobiographies. But now, at last, the legendary author shares the deepest personal story of her life: her
relationship with her mother.
 
For the first time, Angelou reveals the triumphs and struggles of being the daughter of Vivian Baxter, an
indomitable spirit whose petite size belied her larger-than-life presence—a presence absent during much of
Angelou’s early life. When her marriage began to crumble, Vivian famously sent three-year-old Maya and
her older brother away from their California home to live with their grandmother in Stamps, Arkansas. The
subsequent feelings of abandonment stayed with Angelou for years, but their reunion, a decade later, began a
story that has never before been told. In Mom & Me & Mom, Angelou dramatizes her years reconciling with
the mother she preferred to simply call “Lady,” revealing the profound moments that shifted the balance of
love and respect between them.
 
Delving into one of her life’s most rich, rewarding, and fraught relationships, Mom & Me & Mom explores
the healing and love that evolved between the two women over the course of their lives, the love that
fostered Maya Angelou’s rise from immeasurable depths to reach impossible heights.

Praise for Mom & Me & Mom
 
“Mom & Me & Mom is delivered with Angelou’s trademark good humor and fierce optimism. If any
resentments linger between these lines, if lives are partially revealed without all the bitter details exposed,
well, that is part of Angelou’s forgiving design. As an account of reconciliation, this little book is just
revealing enough, and pretty irresistible.”—The Washington Post
 
“Moving . . . a remarkable portrait of two courageous souls.”—People

“[The] latest, and most potent, of her serial autobiographies . . . [a] tough-minded, tenderhearted addition
to Angelou’s spectacular canon.”—Elle
 
“Mesmerizing . . . Angelou has a way with words that can still dazzle us, and with her mother as a subject,
Angelou has a near-perfect muse and mystery woman.”—Essence
 
“True to her style, [Angelou’s] writing cuts to the chase with compression and simplicity, and there in the
background is a calypso smoothness, flurries and showers of musicality between the moments of
wickedness. . . . A tightly strung, finely tuned memoir about life with her mother.”—Kirkus Reviews
 
“In this loving recollection of a complicated relationship, Angelou for the first time details the mother-
daughter journey to reconciliation and unwavering connection and support. . . . Angelou vividly portrays a
spirited woman. . . . [A] remarkable and deeply revealing chronicle of love and healing.”—Booklist
 
“Written with her customary eloquence . . . follows in the episodic style of Angelou’s earlier volumes of



autobiography, pulling the reader along effortlessly. The lessons and the love presented here will speak to
those trying to make their way in the world.”—Publishers Weekly

“In straightforward style, Mom & Me & Mom dives deeply into Angelou’s complicated relationship with her
mother. . . . At 84, Angelou shows few signs of slowing down.”—BookPage
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From reader reviews:

Marlon Taylor:

Exactly why? Because this Mom & Me & Mom is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve waiting
for you to snap this but latter it will distress you with the secret that inside. Reading this book next to it was
fantastic author who write the book in such incredible way makes the content inside of easier to understand,
entertaining means but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having
this anymore or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book
include such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking way. So , still want to postpone having
that book? If I were being you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Adela Valenti:

Mom & Me & Mom can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that
straight away because this guide has good vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in language,
easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The article author giving
his/her effort to get every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Mom & Me & Mom however doesn't
forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm resource information that maybe you
can be among it. This great information can certainly drawn you into fresh stage of crucial thinking.

Olivia Cook:

You can find this Mom & Me & Mom by look at the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it
could to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this book are various.
Not only by written or printed but also can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era including
now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your
personal ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange yourself to make
your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.

Joshua Hsu:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This particular book Mom & Me & Mom was bright colored and of
course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Mom & Me & Mom has many kinds or variety.
Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and believe you are
the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it makes you feel
happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading that will.
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