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The Necklace Affair
by Ashley Gardner
A Captain Lacey Regency Mysteries novella

London 1817
Captain Lacey agrees to track down the missing necklace of a society matron and prove the innocence of her
maid, who has been arrested for the theft. Lady Clifford declares that the rival for her husband's affections
has stolen the necklace, but Lacey soon realizes that the problem is not so simple. He recruits Lady
Breckenridge to infiltrate the Clifford household, while Lacey and his friend Lucius Grenville follow other
leads. The investigation digs up scandal and past secrets, and Lacey finds himself competing with the
underworld criminal, James Denis, for the necklace's retrieval.

This is a 25,000-word (ten-chapter) novella. The events in it occur between the end of The Sudbury School
Murders and the beginning of A Body in Berkeley Square.
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From reader reviews:

Lou Marshall:

The book The Necklace Affair (Captain Lacey Regency Mysteries) give you a sense of feeling enjoy for
your spare time. You may use to make your capable far more increase. Book can to become your best friend
when you getting pressure or having big problem using your subject. If you can make studying a book The
Necklace Affair (Captain Lacey Regency Mysteries) to get your habit, you can get more advantages, like add
your personal capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You are able to know
everything if you like open up and read a guide The Necklace Affair (Captain Lacey Regency Mysteries).
Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you
think about this reserve?

Joseph Moody:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they're still students or it for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they
don't want do that. You must know how great as well as important the book The Necklace Affair (Captain
Lacey Regency Mysteries). All type of book could you see on many sources. You can look for the internet
options or other social media.

Robert Ford:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what you problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man or woman? If you
don't have spare time to do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have time? What did
you do? Everyone has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question due to the fact just their
can do which. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because
start from on pre-school until university need that The Necklace Affair (Captain Lacey Regency Mysteries)
to read.

Ora Orozco:

This book untitled The Necklace Affair (Captain Lacey Regency Mysteries) to be one of several books that
will best seller in this year, that is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will
easily to buy this particular book in the book retailer or you can order it via online. The publisher of this
book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart
phone. So there is no reason to you to past this publication from your list.
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